


    

 
 

  
 

 
 

  
 

 
 

 
 

 
 

 
 

 
 

 

  
 

 

 
 

 
 

 
 

 
 

 
 

Dear Mr. West, 

Can I call you Kanye? We've never met, but you’ve been in my life for years. You were my middle 
school soundtrack, the music I turned to when my vision was first obstructed by the color-line of 
racism. Your music was what I drowned myself in during the lowest moments of my depression 
sophomore year at Pomona College. Your lyrics were the ones that scratched my throat as my best 
friend and I drunkenly yelled them late at night, unsure if we were laughing or crying. 

As I’ve been approaching graduation, I’ve been returning to your music ever more frequently. You 
see, in your first album, you dedicate multiple skits to decrying the uselessness of degrees; that 
accumulated degrees won’t keep you warm when you’re dead (your words, not mine). And as I 
stand here today ready to complete one degree and begin another, I can’t help but wonder if 
you’re right. 

You see, my senior year at Pomona College started with Ferguson and is ending with Baltimore. 
Fellow students in Mexico and Kenya have died pursuing their education. And as I’ve worked and 
sweat here, I’ve felt so, so guilty. I keep returning to your words in “Power”, when you say this: 

I just needed time alone with my own thoughts
 
Got treasures in my mind but couldn't open up my own vault
 

My childlike creativity, purity and honesty is honestly
 
Being crowded by these grown thoughts
 

Reality is catching up with me
 
Taking my inner child I'm fighting for custody
 

With these responsibilities that they entrusted me 

As I look down at my diamond encrusted piece
 

Thinking No One Man should have all that power
 

I’ve been so conflicted and confused. You see, They say we live in a bubble; a campus removed 
from the real world. And now, as we’re graduating, it feels that the bubble is about to burst upon 
contact with reality. But what scares me more than the bubble is the fact that the bubble doesn’t 
exist. That is to say, being at Pomona, and college in general, granted us immense privilege and 
power. But Pomona is the real world. It’s a part of the real world that’s supported by labor of all 
kinds, some made more visible than others. Our gorgeous campus is supported by labor. Our clean 
residence halls are supported by labor. Everything that happens on this campus, good and bad, is 
inextricably tied to the world beyond these gates, and vice versa. 

But don’t get me wrong; I’m conflicted because Pomona College has also changed my life. 
Pomona is where I met the most amazing people; seriously. The faculty, but also the students; 
students who are friends, teachers, warriors, activists, fighters, reformers, jokesters and more. 

To echo Kulsum’s speech yesterday, Pomona is where I learned to practice community. 
Pomona is where I learned to love myself. 

And so maybe it's ok to feel a little guilty; it’s a reminder of the charge I’ve been given. And this 
time is, after all, one of celebration. To celebrate ourselves, our accomplishments, our communities, 
our families. We did it. 

And maybe, Kanye, you’re right about the degrees; maybe they are meaningless. Or maybe their 
meaning is only what we make of it. Maybe what’s more important is the stories these degrees 
represent; the triumphs and struggles, the loves and futures. 
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